
HGACBuy FS12-23 Solicitation
Base Response Price List
Respondent: Kovatch Mobile 

Equipment

Category Manufacturer Model Description List/ MSRP Price Discount (%) No Bid

A - Wildland and Brush                 KME FS23OA01 - Minipumper Ford F-550, 4 x 2, 4-Door, Aluminum Minipumper Body, 250 Gal. Tank, 1000 gpm Midship pump 
$323,254.03 3%

KME FS23OA02 - Ridgerunner International HV507, 4x4, 4-Door, Ridgerunner, Dual Pump, 500/20 Gals Water/Foam, NFPA 1901/1906
$552,312.25 3%

KME FS23OA03 - Interface International HV507, 4 x 4, 4-Door, OEM Interface Pumper, Formed Alum Body, Single Axle, 750 GPM, 500 

Gallon Water $452,582.14 3%

KME FS23OA04 - Defender No 

Upper Body Storage 

International HV507, 4x4, 4-Door OEM Interface Pumper, Fabricated 304L Stainless Steel Body, Single Axle, 

500 PTO GPM and a Darley 1-1/2 AGE 24K Aux Pump, 500 Gallon Water/20 Gallon Foam, No Upper Body 

Storage Compartments. 
$562,078.00 3%

KME FS23OA05 - Defender Upper 

Body Storage

International HV507, 4x4, 4-Door OEM Interface Pumper, Fabricated 304L Stainless Steel Body, Single Axle, 

500 PTO GPM and a Darley 1-1/2 AGE 24K Aux Pump, 500 Gallon Water/20 Gallon Foam,With Upper Body 

Storage Compartments. 

$570,038.00 3%

B - Aerial Fire Apparatus KME FS23OB01 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 79' 500#  Rear Mounted 

Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,338,760.76 5%

KME FS23OB02 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 79' 750#  Rear Mounted 

Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,349,959.76 5%

KME FS23OB03 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 103', 4 Section,  500# Rear 

Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,501,637.22 5%

KME FS23OB04 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 103' Tuff Truck, 4 Section,  

500# Rear Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,552,857.84 5%

KME FS23OB05 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 109', 4 Section,  750# Rear 

Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,559,891.08 5%

KME FS230B06 - Aerial Ladder KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 123', 4 Section,  500# Rear 

Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder
$1,670,786.96 5%

KME FS23OB07 - Aerial Platform KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 102' 1000# Rear Mounted 

Telescoping Ladder with Platform 
$1,725,622.43 5%

KME FS23OB08- Aerial Platfom KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 102' 1000# Mid-Mounted 

Telescoping Ladder with Platform 
$1,831,738.78 5%

KME FS23OB09- Tractor Drawn 

Aerial Ladder

KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tractor Drawn Aerial (TDA), 101', 4 Section 

500# Steel Telescoping Ladder 
$1,836,748.88 5%

KME FS23OB10- Tractor Drawn 

Aerial Ladder

KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tractor Drawn Aerial (TDA), 100', 4 Section 

500# Steel Telescoping Ladder 
$1,822,899.39 5%

C - Pumper Fire Apparatus KME FS23OC01 - Commercial 

Freightliner chassis  

Freightliner M2 106,  2-Door, OEM Pumper, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal 

Tank - Pumper
$412,777.66 3%

KME FS23OC02 - Commercial 

Navistar chassis  

International MV607,  2-Door, OEM Pumper, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 

Gal Tank - Pumper
$422,318.21 3%

KME FS23OC03 - Panther chassis Panther Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 

750 Gal Tank - Pumper
$671,108.43 5%

KME FS23OC04 - Predator chassis Predator Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal Tank - 

Pumper
$692,871.43 5%

KME FS23OC05 - Severe Service 

chassis 

KME Severe Service Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Title, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 

Gal Tank - Pumper
$783,351.96 5%

D - Pumper-Tanker/Tender KME FS23OD01 - Elliptical 1800 

gallon water

International MV607,  2-Door, Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Painted 1800 Gal Elliptical 

Tanker
$358,897.68 3%

KME FS23OD02 - Elliptical 3000 

gallon water

International HV607, 2-Door, Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Painted 3000 Gal Elliptical 

Tanker
$417,113.83 3%

KME FS23OD03 - Wetside 1800 

gallon water 

International MV607, 2-Door, Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 500 GPM Pump, Painted 1800 Gal Wetside 

Tanker
$360,351.23 3%

KME FS23OD04  - Wetside 3000 

gallon water 

International HV607, 2-Door, Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 500 GPM Pump, Painted 3000 Gal Wetside 

Tanker
$423,228.25 3%

KME FS23OD05 - Dryside 1800 

gallon water 

International MV607,  2-Door, Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 750 GPM Pump, 1800 Gal Dryside Tanker
$415,418.06 3%

KME FS23OD06 - Dryside 3000 

gallon water 

International HV607,  2-Door, Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 750 GPM Pump, 3000 Gal Dryside Tanker
$469,480.94 3%

KME FS23OD07 - Pumper/Tanker 

1800 gallon water 

International MV607,  2-Door, Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 1800 Gal  Pumper/Tanker
$414,616.22 3%

KME FS23OD08 - Pumper/Tanker 

3000 gallon water 

International HV607,  2-Door, Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 3000 Gal Pumper/Tanker
$470,480.94 3%

KME FS23OD09 - KME Custom 

chassis Pumper/Tanker 3000 

gallon water 

KME Severe Service, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Tandem Axle, 3,000 Gallon, Pumper-

Tanker with 1250gpm Pump $864,269.11 5%

E - ARFF Vehicles KME
No Bid

F - Special Service Vehicles KME FS23OF01 -  Custom HD Walk 

Around Rescue

KME Custom Chasis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, Heavy Duty Walk-Around 

Body $673,404.54 5%

KME FS23OF02 - Custom HD 

Combination Rescue

KME Custom, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, Heavy Duty Combination Walk-in / 

Walk-Around Body $734,938.86 5%

KME FS23OF03 - Custom HD Walk 

In Rescue 

KME Custom, 2-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, Heavy Duty Combination Walk-in 

Body $722,015.30 5%

G - Fire/Rescue Boats KME
No Bid

H - Command Vehicles KME
No Bid

I - Electric/Alternative Fuel KME FS23OI01 - Vector Rev Fire Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 

500 Gal Tank - Pumper
$1,954,840.00 7%

J - Apparatus Service/Maintenance Plans KME
No Bid



K - Apparatus Parts/Supplies KME REV Fire Parts Customers and Consumers will contact their local KME representatives and request a quote on Parts and 

Supplies stating these items are being purchased from the KME HGAC current contract. 
Varies per item Purchased 3%

L. Published Options KME Please upload separately in Solicitation Section 9.1.4.


